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County of Jefferson

Office of the Purchasing Department
Historic Court House

195 Arsenal Street

Watertown, New York 13601-2565
Phone: 315-785-3077

Fax: 315-785-7591 Senior Account Clerk
) Avis Gilmore

Buyers . Director ,

Karin Dorr Mark Sachetti, CPPB Account Clerk

Amanda McCracken
Mary Ann Shear

NOTICE OF AWARD

June 28, 2021

ATTN JOSHUA E. MUSKAT

UNITED UNIFORM DISTRIBUTION LLC
495 NORTH FRENCH ROAD

BUFFALQO NY 14228

BID #20215-1 & 2021S5-2 NAME: SHERIFF UNIFORMS & DUTY LEATHER
CONTRACT PERIOD: 7/1/21 - 6/30/24
Dear Mr. Muskat:

I am pleased to inform you that your Bid submitted for the solicitation referenced has been accepted based on full
compliance with the specifications, terms and conditions included in the Bid. '

The following documents are required before a Purchase Order is issued:
v Insurance Certificate - Commercial General Liability, Business Automobile Liability
v W-g Tax Form and Vendor Information Form (Attached)
V Other: Please note that Jefferson County must be listed on your Insurance certificates as an additional
ingured as noted in the bid document under Insurance Requirements.

If youhave any qugstions regarding this notice of award please call the Jefferson County Purchasing Department.

rk’Sachetti, Purchasing Director
C: - Department, Auditor, Bid File

SHARED/BIDS/2021s-1&2/UNIFORMS/AWARD TEXT.DOCX



BID #20218-2

DUTY LEATHER RELATED ITEMS
BID TABULATION

FOR THE PERIOD 7/1/21 - 6/30/24

| : ~
! ! UNITED UNIFORM DISTRIBUTORS LLC
(GROUP A) SAFARILAND JULY 1, 2021 THROUGH JULY 1, 2022 THROUGH JULY 1, 2023 THROUGH
f JUNE 30, 2022 JUNE 30,2023 JUNE 30,2024
ESTIMATED
ITEM . ITEM *
# DESCRIPTION N;LGMIJ ER ANNUAL BRAND/I;EM# BEING PRICE EACH TOTAL PRICE EACH TOTAL PRICE EACH TOTAL
QUANTITY
1 GARRISON BELT 51 20 PER SPEC $29.50 $590.00 $29.50 $590.00 $31.00 $620.00
2 GARRISON BELT (BUCKLELESS 1.5") 999 30 PER SPEC $34.50 $1,035.00 $34.50 $1,035.00 $36.00 $1,080.00
3 DUTY BELT S7V 10 PER SPEC $66.00 $660.00 $66.00 $660.00 $68.00 $680.00
4 CONTOUR BELT 942 5 PER SPEC $68.00 $340.00 $68.00 $340.00 $70.00 $350.00
5 S5iIl LEVEL HOLSTER 070 10 PER SPEC $120.00 $1,200.00 $120.00 $1,200.00 $120.00 $1,200.00
SSHI LEVEL RETENTION DUTY
HOLSTER (ALS/SLS (AUTOMATIC
6 LOCKING SYSTEM/SAFARILAND 6360 20 PER SPEC $120.00 $2,400.00 $125.00 $2,500.00 $130.00 $2,600.00
LAMINATE CONSTRUCTION), MID-
RIDE POSITION)
7 SURGICAL GLOVE POUCH 33 10 PEB SPEC $17.00 $170.00 $17.00 $170.00 $18.00 $180.00
8 MACE HOLDER TOP FLAP 38 8 PER SPEC $27.00 $216.00 $27.00 $216.00 $28.50 $228.00
9 BATON RING/CHROME SNAP 67S 5 PER SPEC $8.50 $42.50 48.50 $42.50 $9.50 $47.50
10 {BATON RING, SIDE HANDLE 67 5 PER SPEC $9.50 $47.50 $9.50 $47.50 $10.50 $52.50
11 DOUBLE MAGAZINE HOLDER 77 12 PER SPEC $34.50 $414.00 $34.50 $414.00 $36.50 $438.00
NDCUFF P! TOPF NE y
12 ;{:I\AP OUCH, TOPFLAP, © 90 14 PER SPEC $30.00 $420.00 430.00 $420.00 $32.00 $448.00
13 HANDCUFF POUCH, OPEN TOP 090 100 PER SPEC $26.50 $2,650.00 $26.50 $2,650.00 $28.50 $2,850.00
14 |BELT KEEPER,.75 65 10 PER SPEC $11.00 $110.00 $11.00 $110.00 $12.00 $120.00
15 BELT KEEPER, 1.25 655 10 PER SPEC $6.00 $60.00 $6.00 $60.00 $6.50 $65.00
16 JKEY RING (ONE SNAP) 1695 25 PER SPEC $8.95 $223.75 $8.95 $223.75 $9.50 $2372.50
17 KEY RING 168 5 PER SPEC $14.50 $72.50 $14.50 $72.50 $15.00 $75.00
18 |LIGHT/TASER HOLDER 307 5 PER SPEC $27.50 $137.50 427.50 $137.50 $28.50 $142.50
19  JUNIVERSAL RADIO CARRIER 763 5 PER SPEC $27.50 $137.50 $27.50 $137.50 $28.50 $142.50
CTICAL HOLSTER
20 gi’:'?gs OLS WILIGHT 6004 2 PER SPEC $145.00 $290.00 $145.00 $290.00 $150.00 $300.00
ALS TACTICAL (AUTOMATIC
KING SYSTEM) HOLST!
21 t\S;EIGHT ATrACHIEAEngN:ETRH 6304 .10 PER SPEC $165.00 $1,650.00 $165.00 $1,650.00 $170.00 $1,700.00
MOUNTING HOLES FOR SHROUD
22 |TACTICAL SHROUD 6004-4-2 5 PER SPEC - $12.00 $60.00 $12.00 $60.00 $13.00 $65.00
23 |MACEHOLDER 37 5 PER SPEC $24.50 $122.50 $24.50 $122.50 $25.50 $127.50
24 |BATONHOLDER 35-5 23PBL 7 PER SPEC $27.50 $192.50 $27.50 $192.50 $28.50 $199.50
25 1SINGLE MAGAZINE HOLDER 76 5 PER SPEC $27.50 $137.50 $27.50 $137.50 $28.50 $142.50
26 |HANDCUFF POUCH 19023 PBL 5 PER SPEC $32.50 $162.50 $32.50 $162.50 $33.50 $167.50
27 |POUCH, PADDLEBACK MAG/CUFF 573-83-21 10 PER SPEC $38.50 $385.00 438.50 4385.00 $39.50 $395.00
28 |BADGE HOLDER (OVAL) 7350-04 25 PER SPEC $8.50 $212.50 $8.50 $212.50 $9.50 $237.50
TOTAL SAFARILAND ITEMS $14,138.75 $14,238.75 $14,891.00
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BID #20218-2

DUTY LEATHER RELATED ITEMS

BID TABULATION

FOR THE PERIOD 7/1/21 - 6/30/24

UNITED UNIFORM DISTRIBUTORS LLC
JULY 1, 2021 THROUGH JULY 1, 2022 THROUGH JULY 1, 2023 THROUGH
JUNE 30, 2022 JUNE 30, 2023 JUNE 30,2024
(GROUP B) BIANCHI
’ ESTIMATED
% R
ITEM # DESCRIPTION MFG. ITEM ANNUAL BRAND/ITEM# PRICE EACH TOTAL PRICE EACH TOTAL PRICE EACH TOTAL
NUMBER BEING BID .
QUANTITY
2g |HOLSTER ! 7120 5 PER SPEC $85.00 $425.00 $85.00 $425.00 $87.00 $435.00
30 |MAGAZINE HOLDER 7302 10 PER SPEC $28.50 $285.00 $28.50 $285.00 $29.50 $295.00
31 |HANDCUFF CASE 7300 4 PER SPEC $22.50 $90.00 $22.50 $G0.00 $23.50 $94.00
32 |OC/PEPPER SPRAY HOLDER 7307 3 PER SPEC $18.50 $55.50 $18.50 $55.50 $19.50 $58.50
33 |GUNBELT 7202 10 PER SPEC $34.50 $345.00 $34.50 $345.00 $36.50 $365.00
34 |GUN BELT (LOOP LINED) 7225 5 PER SPEC $60.50 $302.50 $60.50 $302.50 $62.50 $312.50
35 [PROTECTIVE GLOVE CASE 7328 10 PER SPEC $15.50 $155.00 $15.50 $155.00 $16.50 $165.00
36 |MINI MAG LIGHT CASE 7310 5 PER SPEC $16.50 $82.50 $16.50 $82.50 $17.50 $87.50
37 |KEEPERS (4 PACK) 7406 3 PER SPEC $11.50 $34.50 $11.50 $34.50 $12.50 $37.50
EXPANDABLE BATON HOLDER -
ACCUMOLD, MOLDED &
38 |CONTOURED TRILAMINATE 7312 10 PER SPEC $15.50 $155.00 $15.50 $155.00 $16.50 $165.00
CONSTRUCTION W/ COPTEX KNIT
LINING, FITS 2-2.25" DUTY BELTS
L
TOTAL FOR BIANCH! ITEMS $1,930.00 $1,930.00 $2,015.00
(GROUP C) BLACKHAWK AMEGA ELITE
ESTIMATED % )
DESCRIPTION MFG. ITEM ANNUAL BRAND/ITEM# PRICE EACH TOTAL PRICE EACH TOTAL PRICE EACH TOTAL
NUMBER BEING BID
QUANTITY .
39 |TRIPLE PISTOL/DOUBLE CUFF 56TPDCBK 5 DISCONTINUED NO BID NO BID NO BID
40 SHOT SHEEL TRIPLE MAG 5655PMBK 5 DISCONTINUED NO BID NO BID NO BID
41 PISTOL MAG FLASH BANG 56PMFBBK 3 DISCONTINUED NO BID NO BID NO BID
GAS MASK POUCH - 500 DENIER
RIPSTOP NYLON, ADJ
REMOVEABLE SHOULDER STRAP,
42 |Y HARNESS CONFIG. SIDE 56GM00BK 10 PER SPEC $55.00 $550.00 $55.00 $550.00 $57.50 $575.00
RELEASE BUCKLES WITH .
HOOK/LOOP CLOSURE,
1"HX5-7.25"WX4:D
SERPA CONCEALMENT HOLSTER, o
43 atre FINISH 410500BK ' PER SPEC $42.50 $42.50 $42.50 $42.50 $42.50 $42.50
TOTAL FOR BLACKHAWK ITEMS $592.50 $592.50 $617.50
(GROUP D) MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS:
ESTIMATED .
*|
DESCRIPTION MFG. ITEM ANNUAL "BRAND/ITEM# PRICE EACH TOTAL PRICE EACH TOTAL PRICE EACH TOTAL
NUMBER BEING BID
QUANTITY
44 |STREAMLIGHT M3 FOR GLOCKS 5 69110 $135.00 $675.00 $135.00 $675.00 $137.50 $687.50
MAGLITE MINI MAG (WITH AA
45 BATTERIES & CASE) MLMZAO1H 10 PER SPEC NO 81D NO BID NOBID
MONADNOCK OFFICER SERIES
46 BATON 23" W/POWER SAFETY TIP 2523 10 PER SPEC NOBID NO BID NO BID
AUTO LOCK BATON HOLDER FOR
47 135.26" BATONS 3034 10 PER SPEC $30.50 $305.00 $30.50 $305.00 $32.50 $325.00
PEERLESS BLACK HINGED
48 HANDCUFFS 10 802C $39.50 $395.00 $39.50 $395.00 $41.50 $415.00
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BID #20218-2
DUTY LEATHER RELATED ITEMS
BID TABULATION

FOR THE PERIOD 7/1/21 - 6/30/24

UNITED UNIFORM DISTRIBUTORS LLC
JULY 1, 2021 THROUGH JULY 1, 2022 THROUGH JULY 1, 2023 THROUGH
JUNE 30, 2022 JUNE 30, 2023 JUNE 30,2024
i
|
|
(GROUP D) MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS:
MFG. ITEM *BRAND/ITEM# :
DESCRIPTION NUMBER BEING BID PRICE EACH TOTAL PRICE EACH TOTAL PRICE EACH TOTAL
PEERLESS STANDARD 00C $29.50 $26.50 $29.50 $20.50 $30.50 $30.50
49 HANDCUFFS 7 9-5 9-5 9.5 9-5 30.5 30.5
50 |PEERLESS HANDCUSS KEY STANDARD $2.00 $2.00 $2.00 $2.00 $2.00 $2.00
PER SPEC
BADGE CASE, STRONG LEATHER
51 €O., BADGE SHAPE - 423 77500-423 PER SPEC $16.50 $16.50 $16.50 $16.50 $17.50 $17.50
52 JJAYPEE KEY HOLDER JP26D PER SPEC $8.50 $8.50 $8.50 $8.50 $8.50 $9.50
JAYPEE KEY HOLDER (METAL) -
53 FITS 2" BELTS JP-MKRK PER SPEC $10.50 $10.50 $10.50 $10.50 $11.50 $11.50
JAYPEE VELCRO RADIO HOLDER -
54 |LEATHER, FITS 2" BELTS, JP-RCY PER SPEC $19.50 $19.50 $19.50 $19.50 $20.50
" |HOOK/LOOP RADIO STRAP : £0.50
ZARCINTERNATIONAL PEPPER
SPRAY BLACK LEATHER HOLSTER,
55 |wiTH BRASS SNAP AND SOLID PSH-1303L1 PER SPEC $31.50 $31.50 $31.50 $31.50 $32.50 $32.50
STEEL 7/8" WIDE BELT CLIP
ZARC INTERNATIONAL PEPPER
SPRAY BLACK LEATHER HOLSTER
56 WITH SILVER SNAP & SOLID STEEL PSH-1303C0 PER SPEC NO BID NO BID N(? BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
7/8" SIDE BELT CLIP.
ZARCINTERNATIONAL BLACK
LEATHER PEPPER SPRAY HOLSTER
57 |WITH COMPLETELY STITCHED 2- | PSH-1303L0 PER SPEC $31.50 $31.50 $31.50 $31.50 $32.50 $32.50 -
1/4" WIDE BELT LOOP AND SILVER
SNAP,
NORD-RAY GARRISON BELTS,
58 [aiack, winBuckie 1620 PER SPEC $14.50 $14.50 saso | s1450 $15.50 $15.50
TOTAL FOR MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS $164.00 $164.00 $172.00
|
COMMENTS:
DEVIATIONS: |
ALL DATA IS PRELIMINARY AND DQCUMENTED AT THE TIME OF BID OPENING, SUBJECT TO ERRORS OR OMISSIONS.
THIS DATA SHOULD Nga’BE Ig;r/EﬁPRETED AS CONFIRMATION OF BID RESULTS UNLESS SIGNED BY THE JEFFERSON COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT. i
THIS BID TABULAT19I< /DGE?NOT IMPLY.AN'AWARD HAS BEEN MADE UNLESS NOTED, :
J— s ] . )
= = = 7
<~/ A — ! -~ /B %7
! PURCHASING ; | oafe |/

o’

S:\SHARED\BIDS & QUOTES\A-Z Bids & Quotes\BID BOOK UNIFORM SUPPLIES\UNIFORM SUPPLES BID BOOK 2021 Exp 6-30-2512021 Tabulations\20218-2 Duty Leather tabulation



